
139 

THE CRIMINAL LAW (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2003 

No. S of 1003 

Date of Assent: 18th July, 2003 

Date of Commencement: 25th JulYr 2003 

An Act of Parliament to make amendmeats to tile crimiDal 
add penal law and for coaneeted purposes 

ENACTED by the ParHament of Kenya as follows:-

1. This Act may be cited as'the Criminal Law 
Am~dment Act, 2003. 

, shrxt title. 

2~ The Penal Code is amended by repealing section 3. ""of-*-3 
mOlp.61. 

· 3. Section 24 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting paragraph (d). 

4. SectiOn 26 of the Penal Code is ~ended in ' 
subsection (3), by deleting ,paragraph (ii). 

S. The Penal Code is amended by repealing 
section 27. 

6. Section 28 of the Penal Code is amended in 
subsection (2), by deleting the figurcs."l00", "500", 
"3000" and "10,000" wherever they o<;cur and 
substituting therefor the figures "500", "2,500", ")5,000" 
and "50,000" respectively. 

7. Section 37 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "or of corporal punishment". 

I. Section 38 of the Penal Code is amended in 
paragrapb (a), by deleting the words "fine or corporal 
punishment" and substituting therefor the words "or 
fin " . e. 

AIIw.dtIEiIt m 
III'ICIion 24 me.. 
63. 

' ........... _m 
acticJR 26 mCtip. 
63. 

AnwI6s II f.'I 
.-l9-c.. 
63. 

""-'It,a. m 
section 37 of'CIp. 
6.1. 

Arnendmr.nt of 
section 38 of'Cap. 
63. 



No.5 

Amendment of 
section 77 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 96 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 98 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section tot of Cap, 
63. 

Repeal of section 
112A of Cap. 63. 

140 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 2003 

9. Section 77 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting subsection (2). 

10. Section 96 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "three years" and substituting therefor 
the words "five years." 

11. Section 98 of the Penal Code is amended by . 
deleting subsection (5). 

12. Section 101 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting subsection (3). 

13. The Penal Code is amended by repealing section 
112A and replacing it with the following section~ 

Malicious 
information. 

s 251. 

lI2A. (1) Any person who, with intent. 
to cause harm or inconvenience to another 

',.', 

person, gives or makes to--

(a) any magistrate or member of the 
~A,hc~ force~ or 

(b) any officer having power to 
app:::'l"'hend ,,)1' order the 
apprehen':;lon of 0ffenders, 

any information or comr i ... int in relJtjon 
to that other person that he kr.i.~'NS to be 
false is guilty of a misdemeanour or, 
where subsection (3) or (4) applies, ~ a 
felony. 

(2) \Vhere, as a result of an offence 
under this section, any person sust~ 
actual bodily ~the offender sltp 
conviction be, . fi~ t<;) be ~ishe. r 

assault occasiM:~ actual ~dilY ~/.: 
(3) \Vhere) 3.l a. result of~ offence," 

under this section~ any person sust_ 
o t 



2003 

s.234. 

s.205. 

141 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 

grievous harm, the offender shall on 
conviction be liable to be punished as for 
doing grievous harm. 

(4) Where, as a result of an offence 
under this section, any person dies, the 
offender shall on conviction be liable to 
be punished as for manslaughter. 

(5) For the purposes of this section, any 
harm to or death of a person shall be 
deemed to have resulted from an offence 
under this section if the court is satisfied 
that, as a matter of fact, and without 
regard to the actions or motivations of any 
person other than the offender, the harm 
would not have been done Or the death 
would not have occurred, as the case may 
he, if the offence had not been committed. 

14. The Penal Code is amended by inserting the 
ifllowing heading and new sections immediately after 
s&tion 122-

Senior police 
otr.ermay 
order DNA 
sanltling 
pl'08cdure on 
suspeCt. 

SAMPLING FOR DNA IDENTIFICATION 

122A. (1) A police officer of or above the 
rank of inspector may by order in writing 
require a person suspected of having 
committed a seriouS offence to undergo a 
DNA sampling procedure if there are 
reasonable grounds to believe that the 
procedure might produce evidence tending 
to confirm or disprove that the suspect 
committed the alleged offence. 

(2) In this section-

"DNA sampling procedure" means a 
procedure, carried out by a medical 
practitioner, consisting o{.-

No.5 

Insertion of 
sections 122A-
122D in Cap. 
63. 



No.5 
142 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 2003 

SusFtto 
comply with 
order. 

Suspect may 
volunteer. 

(a) the taking of a s~ple of saliva or a 
sample by buccal swab; 

(b) the taking of a sample of blood; 

(c) the taking of a sample of hair from 
the head or underann; Uf 

(d) the taking of a sample from a 
fingernail or toenail or from under 
the nail, 

for the purpose ofperfonning a test or 
analysis upon the sample in order to 
confinn or disprove a supposition 
.concerning the identity of the person who 
committed a particular crime; 

"serious offence" means an offence 
punishable by imprisonment for a tenn of 
twelve months or more. 

122B. Where a ~uspect in resp~t of 
whom an order has been made under 
section 122A resists compliance witb..the 
order, members of the police force, under 
supervision of an officer of or above the 
rank of inspector, shall be entitled to use 
reasonable force in restraining the suspect 
for the purpose of ,effecting the procedure. 

122c. (1) Nothing in section 122A shall 
be construed as preventing a suspect from 
undergoing a procedure by consent, 
without any order having been made: 

Provided that every such consent shall 
be recorded in writing signed by the 
person giving the consent. 

(2) Such consent may, where the suspect 
is a child.or an incapable person, be given 
by the suspect's parent or guardian. 



2003 

Order or 
consent to be 
proven. 

143 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 

122D. The results of any test or analysis 
carried out on a sample obtained from a 
DNA sampling procedure within the 
meaning of section 122A shan not be 
admissible in evidence ~t the request of 
the prosecution in any proceedings against 
the suspect unless an order under section 
122A or a consent under section 122c is 
first proven to have been made or given. 

15. Section 140 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "with or without corporal 
punishment" . 

16. Section 141 of the Penal Lode is amended by 
deleting the words "with or without corporal 
punishment". 

17. Sectton 143 of the Penal Code is amended-

(a) by inserting the words "boy or" before the word 
"girl"; 

(b) by inserting the words ''his or" before the word 
''ber'' where firstly occurring; 

(c) by inserting the words ''him or" before the word 
''ber'' where secondly occurring. 

18. Section 144 of the Penal Code is amended-

(a) in subsection (I), by deleting the words "five 
years~ with or without corporal punishment" and 
substituting therefor the words "twenty-one 
years"; 

(b) in subsection (2), by deleting the words "fourteen 
years" wherever they occur and sl:lbstituting 
therefor the words "sixteen years", 

No.5 

Amendment of 
section 140 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 141 of 
Cap. 63. 

Amendment of 
section 143 of 
Cap. 63. 

Amendment of 
section 144 of Cap. 
63. 



No.5 

Repeal and 
replacement of 
section 145 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 146 of 
Cap. 63. 

Amendment of 
section 147 of 
Cap. 63. 

144 

CFiminal Lnw (Amendment) 2003 

19. The Penal Code is amended by repealing section 
145 and replacing it with the following section-

Defilement of 
girls under 16 
years. 

145. (1) Any person who unlawfully 
and carnally knows any girl under the age 
of sixteen years is guilty'of a felony and is 
liable to imprisonment with hard labour 
for life. 

(2) Any person who attempts to have 
unlawful carnal know ledge 0 f a girl under 
the age of sixteen years is guilty of a 
felony and is liable to imprisonment with 
hard labour for life: 

Provided that it shaH be a sufficient 
defence to any charge under this section if 
it is made to appear to the court before 
whom the charge is brought that the 
person so charged had reasonable cause to 
believe and did in fact believe that the girl 
was above the age of sixteen years or was 
his wife. 

20. Section 146 of the Penal Code is amende.d-

(a) by deleting the words ''woman or girl" wherever 
occurring and substituting the word "person"; 

(b) by deleting the words "knowledge of her" and 
substituting the words "conneetion with him or 
her"~ 

(c) by deleting the words ''with or without corpora] 
punishment" . 

21. S~ction 147 of the Penal Code is amended­

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting the words "girl or 
woman" and substituting the word "person"; 

(b) in paragraph (b), (c) and (d) by deleting the 
words ''woman or girl" wherever occurring and 
substi tuting the word "person"~ 



145 
,2003 Criminal Law (Amendment) 

(c) in paragraphs (c) and (d) by inserting the words 
"he or" before the word "she" wherever 
occurring; 

(d) in paragraph (d) by inserting the words "his or" 
before the word "her"; 

(e) by deleting all words appearing after paragraph 
( c) and substituting the words "is guilty of a 
felony and is liable to imprisonment for lifeH

• 

22. Section 148 of the Penal Code is ame~ded­

(a) in paragraphs (a) and (b) by deleting the words 
'woman or girl" wherever occlirr'i:ng and 
substituting the word "person"; 

(b) in paragraph (c) by deleting the words 'woman 
or girl" where firstly occurring and substituting 
'the word "person"; 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting the words ''woman 
or girl" where secondly occurring and 
substituting the words "him or her"; 

(d) by deleting all words appearing after paragraph 
(d) and substituting the words ~'is guilty 0 fa 
felony and is liable to imprisonment for life". 

23. Section 149 of the Penal Code is amended-. 

(a) by inserting the words ''hoy or" before the word 
"girl" wherever occurri,ng; 

(b) by deleting the words "thirteen years" wherever 
they occur and substituting therefor the words 
"sixteen years"; 

(c) by deleting the words "being unlawfully and 
carnally known by any man, whether the carnal 
knowledge is intended to be with any particular 
man" and substituting the words "havillg 
unlawful sexual connection with any person, 
whether the sexual connection is intended to be 
with any particular person"; 

(d) by deleting the words "five years" and 
substituting therefor the word "life". 

No.'S 

Ari1endrnent of 
section 148 of 
Cap. 63. 

Amcndmc::nt of 
section t 49 of Cap. 
63. 



No.5 

Repeal of section 
150 of Cap. 63. 

Amendment of 
section 151 of 
Cap. 63. 

146 

,Criminallnw (Amendment) 

24. The Penal Code is amended by re'pealing 
section 150. 

25. Section 151 of the Penal Code is amended­

(a) by deleting subsections (1) and (2) and 
substituting the following subsections-

(1) Any person who detains any other person 
against his o~ her will-

2003 

(a) in or upon any premises with intent that he or 
she may have unlawful sexual connection 
with any person, whether any particular 
person or generall y; or 

(b) in any brothel, 

is guilty of a felony. 

(2) A person in or upon any premises for the 
• purpose of having any unlawful sexual connection, or 

in any brothel, shall be deemed to be detaine~ therein 
by any other person who, with iiitent to compel or 
induce that person to remain in or upon the premises 
or in the brothel-

(a) withholds from that person any wearing 
apparel or other property belonging to that 
person; or 

(b) where wearing apparel has been lent or 
otherwise supplied to that person by or at his 
direction, threatens thaf4person with legal 
proceedings in the event that that person 
should take away the wearing apparel so lent 
or supplied. 

(b) in subsection (3) by deleting the words "woman 
or girl" and substituting the word "person". 



f47 
2003 Criminal Law (Amendment) 

26. Section 152 o(the Penal Code is repealed and 
replaced by the following section-

Power of search 
for persons 
detained. 

152. (1) If it appears to any magistrate~ 
on infonnation laid before him on oath 
by-

(a) any parent~ relative or guardian of 
a person named in the 
infonnation; or 

(b) any other informant who, in the 
. opinion of the magistrate, is 
acting bona fide in the interests of 
the person so named, 

that there is reasonable cause to suspect 
that the person named in the inf9rmation 
is unlawfully detained for immoral 
purposes by any person in any place 
within the jurisdiction of the magistrate, 
the magistrate may issue a warrant 
authorising the person charged with its 
execution to search for and, when found, 
to take to and detain in a place of safety 
the pe{son named in the infonnation until 
he or she can be brought before a 
magistrate. 

(2) The magistrate before whom the 
person concerned is brought may cause 

,: the person to be delivered up to his or her 
parents or guardians or to be otherwise 
dealt with as circumstances may require. 

(3) A magistrate issuing a warrant 
under subsection (1) may 'by the same or 
another warrant cause any person accused 
of unlawfully detaining the person 
concerned to be apprehended and brought 
before a magistrate, where he shall be 
dealt with according to law. 

No.5 

RepeaJ and 
replacement of 
sectibn 152 of 
Cap. 63. 



No.5 

Amendm:nt of 
sction.l5lofCap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section IS3 of Cap. 
63. 

148 

Criminal Law (A~endment) 2003 

(4) A person shall be deemed to be 
unlawfully detained for immoral purposes 
if-

(a) the person is detained for. the 
purpose of having unlawful sexual 
connection with any person, 
whether any particular person or 
generally; and 

(b) the person-
(i) is under the age of sixteen 

years; or 
(ii) being of or over the age of 

sixteen years and under the 
age of eighteen years, is so 
detained against his or her 
will or against the will of his 
or her father or mother or any 
person having the laWful care 
ot charge of him or her; or 

(iii) being of or oyer the age of 
eighteen years, is so detained 
'against his or her own Will. 

(5) Any person authorised by warrant 
under this section to search for any person 
detained as abovementioned may entet (if 
need 'be, by force) any house, building or 
other place mentioned in the warrant, and. 
may remove the person therefrom. 

27. Section 151 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the word "misdemeanour" and subs~ituting 
therefor the word "felony". 

28. Section 153 of the Penal Code is amended in 
subsection (1) by deleting all the words appearing 
immediately after paragraph (b) and substituting therefor· 
the words "is guilty of a felony". 



149, 

Criminal lAw (Amendment) 

29. Section 154 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the word ''misdemeanoqr'' and sUbstituting 
therefor the word "felony". 

30. Section 156 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the word "misdemeanour" and substituting 
therefor the word "felony". 

31. Section 157 of the Penal Code is amended­

(a) by deleting the w9rds "with or without corporal 
punishment"; 

(b) ~y renumbering the section as subsection (1) and 
, inserting thereafter the following subsectioIr-

(2) Any person who conspires with an,?ther to 
induce any man or boy, by means of any false 
pretence or pther fraudulent means, to permit 
any person to have unlawful sexual connexion 
with him is guilty of a felony and is liable to 
.sonment for three years. 

32. Section 162 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting all words appearing after paragraph (c) and 
substitlJting therefor the following words and proviso-

is guilty of a felony and is liable to imprisomnent for 
fourteen years; 

Provided that, in the &.;aSC of an offence Under 
paragr~h (a), the offender shall be liable to impris­
onment for. twenty--one y~ if-

(i) the offence'was committed without the con­
sent of the person who was carnally known; 
or' 

(ii) the offence was committed with that person's 
e-0QSeD.t but tb.e 99~t was obta!n~ by 
ror&e or by means of tbreats or intimidation 
of some kind, or by fear of bodily harm, or 
by means of false representations as to ~e 
nature of the act. 

No.5 

Am:ndnlIIlt of 
section lS4ofCap. 
63. 

Arnendmant of 
section l56 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 157 of 
Cap. 63. 

Ammdmentof 
section 162 of Cap. 
63. 



No.5 

Amendment of 
section 163 of 
Cap. 63. 

Amendment of 
section 164 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 165 of Cap. 
63. 

Repeal of section 
169 of Cap. 63. 

Repeal of section 
183 of Cap. 63. 

Amendment of 
section 195 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 229 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 223 of Cap. 
63. 

150 
Criminal LAw (Amendment) 2003 

33. Section 163 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "with or without corporal 
punishment". 

34. Section 164 of the Penal Code is amended-

(a) by deleting the words "fourteen years" and 
substituting therefor the words "eighteen years"; 

(b) by deleting the words "seven years, with or 
without corporal punishment" and substituting 
therefor the words "twenty-one years". 

35. Section 165 of the Penal Code is amendedby 
deleting the words "with or without corporal 
punishment" . 

36. The Penal Code is ~ended by repealing 
section 169~ 

37. The Penal Code is amended by repealing 
section 183. 

38. Section 195 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the proviso. 

39. Section 221 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words ''with or without corporal 
punishment" . 

40. Section 223 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting subsection (2). 

Amendment of 41. Section 229 of the Penal Code is amended by 
section 229 of Cap. 
63. . deleting the words "with or without corporal 

punishment" . 



151 

2003 Criminal ww (Amendment) 

.42. Section 231 of the Penal Code is am~nded by 
d~leting the words "with or without corporal 
punishment" . 

43. Section 233 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "with or without corporal 
punislunenf' . 

44. Section 234 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words ''with or without corporal 
punishment" . 

45. Section 237 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words ''with or without corporal 
punishment" . 

46. The Penal Gode is amended by inserting the 
. following new section immediately after section 242-

Supply ofharrnful 
substances to 
children. 

242A. (1) Any person who supplies or 
offers to a child-

(a) any petroleum distillate, glue or. 
other substance consisting, of or 
containihg matter having 
stupefying or hallucinogenic 
properties; or 

~) any substance which the Minister 
responsible for hea1th has 
declared, by notice published in 
the Gazette, to be a substance to 
which this section applies, 

with intent that the child should inhale, 
consume or otherwise abuse the 
substance, or knowing or having 
reasonable cause to suspect that the child 
is likely to do so, is guilty of a 
misdemeanour and Hable to imprisonment 
for three years. 

No.5 

Amendment of 
section 231 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of se 
lion 233 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 234 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 237 of Cap. 
63 .. 

Insertion of section 
242A in Cap. 63 . 



No.5 

Amendment of 
scctioo 2S1 of Cap. 
63. . 

Ammdf)1lCnt of 
sectim. 278 of Cap. 
63 . 

.Amrendmcnt of 
section 278A of 
Cap.·63. 

Ammdnaltof 
sectioo 2788 of 
Cap. 63 . 

.Amrendmcnt of 
sectioo 279 of Cap. 
63. 

Ammdmentof 
8CIeticn 296 of Cap. 
63. 

152 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 2003 

No. 8 of 2001. 

No.4 of 1994. 

(2) The provisions of this section are in 
addition to, and do not limit the operation 
of-

(a) any provision of Chapter XX or 
XXII or any other provision of 
this Code; 

(b) the provisions of sections 16 and 
22 of the Children Act; or 

(c) the provisions of the Narcotic 
Drugs and Psychotropic 
Substances (Control) Act or any 
other written law. 

(3) In this section, "child" means a 
person under the age of eighteen years.· 

47. Section 251 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "with or with<;>ut corporal 
punishmen t" . 

48. Section 278 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words 4'together with corporal punishment". 

49. Section 278A of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words 4'together with corporal punishment". 

SO. Section 278B of the Penal Code is amended 
deleting the words ''together with corporal punishment". 

51. Section 279 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words 4'together with corporal punishment". 

52. Section 296 of th~ Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words ''together with corporal punishment 
not exceeding twenty-eight strokes". 



153 

2003 Criminal Law (Amendment) 

53. Section 297 of the Penal Code is amended by. 
deleting the words "together- with corporal punishment 
not exceeding fourteen strokes", 

54. Section 304 of the Penal Code is amended in 
subsection (2) by deleting the words "together with 
corpora] punishment". 

-55. Section 306 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting the words "together with corporal punishment". 

56. Section 308 of the Penal Code is amenqed in 
subsection (2) by deleting the words "together with 
corporal punishment". 

57. Section 339 of the Penal Code is amended in 
subsection (2) by deleting the words "with or without 
corpora] punishment." 

58. Section 389 of the Penal Code is amended by 
deleting all the words ,appearing after the words . 
"exceeding seven years". 

59, Section 2 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended-

(a) by inserting the following definition in 
appropriate alphabetical sequence-

"complainant" means a person who lodges a 
complaint with the police or any other lawful 
authority; 

(b) by deleting the definition of "committal 
proceedinpr" 

No.5 

AJ:nendmmt of 
section 297 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendmmtof 
section 297 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 297 of Cap. 
63. 

AJ:nend:mcnt of 
section 308 of Cap. 
63. 

Amendment of 
section 339 of Cap. 

·63. 

A.mendmcnt of 
section 389 of Cap. 
63. 

A.m:ndrnent of 
section 2 olCap. 
75. 



No.5 

Amendment of 
secti~ 7 ofCIQl. 
75. 

Amendment of 
section 30 of Cap. 
75. -

Amendment of 
sectiofl 44 of Cap. 
75. 

Amendmc=nt of 
section 69-of Cap. 
75. 

A.rnendment of 
section 69 of Cap. 
75.' 

154 

Criminal LAw (Amendme~t) 2003 

60~ Section 7 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended-

(a) in.subsectiop. (2), by deleting paragraph (c); 

(b) in subsection (3), by deleting paragraph (c); 

(c) by deleting subsection (4). 

61. Section 30 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended-

(a) by deleting paragraph (b); 

(b) by deleting paragraph (c). 

.62. SectiQn 44 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended by deleting paragraph (a). 

63. Section 69 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended by deleting the proviso thereto. 

64. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 77 and replacing it with the following 
new section-

Court to be open. . 77. (l) Subject to subsedion, (2), the 
place in which a criminal court is held' ,for 
the purpose of trying an offence shall be 
deemed an open court to which the public 
generally may have access, so far as it can 
conveniently contain them: 

Provided that the presiding judge or 
tpagistrate may order at any stage of the 
tri¥ of any particular case that the public 
generally or any particular person shall 
not have access to or remain in the room 
or building used by the court. 

(2) Notwithstanding the provisions of 
subsection (I), the proceedings in the trial 



155 
2003 Criminal Law (Amendment) 

of any case under sections 140, 141, 145, 
Cap. 63. 166 and 167 of the Penal Code shall be 

held in private and no person shall, in 
relation to such trial, publish or cause to 
be published by any means-

(a) ~y particulars calculated to lead to 
the identIfication of the victi~; or 

(b) any picture of the victim. 

(3) A person who contravenes 
the provisions of subsection (2) commits 
an offence and is liable on conviction-

(a) in the case of an individual, to a 
fine not exceeding one hundred 
thousand shillingS; and . 

(b) ~ the case of a body corporate, to a 
fine not exceeding five hundred 
thousand shillings. 

65. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 77 A. . 

66. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 79 arid replacing it with the following 
new section-

Transfer of cases 
between 
magistrates. 

79. A magistrate holding a subordinate 
court of the first class-

(a) may transfer a case of which he has 
taken cognizance to any 
magistrate holding a subordinate 
court empowered to try that case 
within the local limits of the first 
class subordinate courts' 
jurisdiction; and 

(b) may direct or empower a 
magistrate holding a subordinate 
court of the second class who has 

No.5 

Repeal of section 
77AofCap.75. 

Reptaland 
replacement of 
section 79 of Cap. 
75. 



No.5 

Repeal and 
repl.acement of 
section 80 of Cap. 
75. 

Ammdrnent of 
section 82 of Cap. 
7S. 

Repeal of section 
84ofCap7S. 

Amc:.ndment of 
sedioo 86 of Cap. 
1S. 

AmaldmeRt of 
section 123ofCap. 
1S. 

156 

Criminallo,w (Ame~menl) 1003 

taken cognizance of a case and 
whether evidence has been taken 
in that case or not, to transfer it 
for trial to himself or to any other 
specified magistrate within the 
local limits of his jurisdiction who 
is G:ompetent to try the accus~d 
and that magistrate shall dispose 
of the case accordingly. ' 

67. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 80 and replacing it with the following 
new section-
Transfer of part­
heard cases. 

80. If in the. course of any trial before a 
magistrate the evidence appears to 
warrant a presumption that the case is one 
which should be tried by some other 
magistrate, he shall stay proceedings and 
submit the case with a brief report thereon 
to a magistrate holding a sub.ordinate 
court of the first class empowered to 
direct the transfer of the case under 
section 79. 

68. Section 82 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended in subsection (2) by deleting all the words 
appearing after the words ''the accused maybe detained". 

69. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 84. 

70. Section 86 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended by deleting the words "committal proceedings" 
immediately after the word "he has charge -is under'. 

71. Section'l23 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended by deleting subsection (3) and substituting 
therefor the following new subsection-



157 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 

(3) The High Court may in any case direct that an 
accused person be admitted to bailor that bail required 
by a subordinate court or police officer he reduced. 

72. Section 149 of the Criminal Procedure Code'is 
amended in subsection (1) by' deleting the words "four 

I hundred" and substituting therefor the words "five 
thousand" . 

73. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
,I repealing section 164 and replacing it with the following 
new section--

~onof 
praceediitp Or 
trial. 

164. Wherever a trial is postponed under 
section 162 or section 280, the court may 
at any"time, subject to the provisions of 
section 163, resume trial and require the 
accused to appear or be broqght ·before the 
court, whereupon, ifthe'court considers the 
accused to be still incapable of making his 
defence, it shall aCt as if the accused were 
brought before·it for the fmt time. 

74. The criminai Procedure. Code is amended by 
I repealing section 165. 

75. Section 167 of the climinal Procedure Code is 
amended in subsection (1) by deleting paragraph (b) and 
subs~tuting therefor the following new paragraph-

(b) in cases tried by the High Court, the Court shall 
try the case and at the close thereof shall either 
acquit the accused person or, ifsatisfied that the 
evidence would justify a conviction, shall order 
that the accused person be detained during the 
President's pleasure. 

No.S 

Amendl11ll1t of 
Section 1490fCap. 
7.s. 

RepeaJand 
repJacement of 
section 164 of Cap. 
7S. 

Repeal of section 
165 of Cap. 75. 

Amendment of 
section 167 of Cap. 
75. 



No.5 

Amendment of 
section 167 of Cap. 
75. 

Repea1and, 
replacement of 
section 171 of Cap. 
75. 

158 
Criminal liJw (Amendment) 2003 

76. Section 170 of the Criminal Procedure C;ode is 
amended by deleting the words" and the copy shall be 
given free of charge". 

77. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 1 71 and· replacing it with the following 
new section-

Power to order 
costs against 
accused or 
private 
prosecutor. 

171. (1) A judge of the High Court or a 
magistrate of a subordinate court of the first or 
second class may order a person convicted 
before him of an offence to pay to the public 
or private prosecutor, as the case may be, such 
reasonable costs as the judge or magistrate 
may deem fit, in addition to any other penalty 
imposed. 

(2) A judge of the High Court or a 
magistrate of a subordinate court of the first or 
second class who acquits or di,scharges a 
person accused of an offence may, if the 
prosecution for the offence was originally 
instituted on a summons or warrant issued by 
a court on the application of a private 
prosecutor, order the private prosecutor to pay 
to the accused such reasonable costs as the 
judge or magistrate may deem fit: 

Provided that-

(i) the costs shall not exceed twenty 
thousand shillings in the High Court 
or ten thousand shillings in the case of 
an acquittal or discharge by a 

. subordinate court; and 

(ii) no such ~rder shalJ be made if the judge 
or magistrate considers that the private 
prosecutor had reasonable grounds for 
making his complaint. 



159 

2003 Criminal Law (Amendment) 

78 •. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
deleting section 175 and substituting therefor the 
following section-

Orders for 
compensation 
and expenses. 

175. (1) A court 'Yhich-

(a) on convicting a person of an 
offence, imposes a fine, or a 
sentence of which a fine fonns part; 
or 

(b) on appeal, revision or othetwise, 
confinns such a sentence, 

may, when passing judgment, order the 
whole or any part of the fine recovered to 
be applied in defraying expenses properly 
incurred in the prosecution of the offence. 

(2) A court which-

(a) convicts a person of an offence or, 
on appeal, revision or othetwise, 
confinns the conviction; and 

.(b) finds, on the facts proven in the 
case, that the convicted person has, 
by virtue of the act constituting the 
offence, a civil liability to the 
complainant or another person (in 
either case referred to in this section 
as the "injured party"), 

may order the convicted person to pay to 
the injured party such sum as it considers 
could justly be recovered as damages in 
civil proceedings brought by the injured 
party against the' convicted person in respect 
of th~ civil liability concerned: 

(3) No order shall be made under 
subsection (2)--

(a) so as to require payment of an 
, amount that exceeds the amount 

that the court making the order is 

No.5 

Repeal and 
replacement of 
section 17S of Cap. 
15. 



-No.5 

Cap. 22. 

160 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 

authorised by law to award or 
confirm as damages in civil 
proceedings; or' 

2003 

(b) in any case where~ by reason of-­
(i) the complexity of evidentiary 

matters affecting the quantum 
of damages; 

(ii) the insufficiency of evidence 
before it in relation to such 
damages. or their quantum; 

(iii) the provisions of the Limitation 
of Actions Act; or 

(iv) any other circumstances, 

the court considers that such an 
order would unduly prejudice the 
rights of the convicted person'in 
respect of the civil 1iabi.lity. 

(4) No order under this section shall take 
effect-

(a) before the expiry of the time limited 
for appeal against the c~nviction Or 
sentence in re.spect of which the 
order was made; or 

(b) while any such conviction or . 
sentence is the subject of appeal, 
unless and until the conviction or 
sentence, and the order, are 
confirmed by the court determining 
the appeal. 

(5) A court detennining an appeal 
referred to in subsection (4) shall affirm, 
quash or vary an order under this section, as 
justice requires. 

(6) An order under this'section that has 
taken effect is enforceable in the same 
manner as a judgment in civil proceedings 
for the amount awarded by the order. 



2003· 

161 

Criminallo.w (Amendment) 

(7) An award by order under this section 
in respect of a civil liability is, to the extent 
of the amount awarded, a defence in any. 
subsequent proceedings instituted in 'respect 
of that liability. 

79. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
inserting the following new section immediately after 
section 193-

Concurrent 
criminal and 
civil 

)Ceedings. 

193A. Notwithstanding the provisions of 
any-other written law, the fact that any 
matter in issue in any criminal proceedings 
is also directly or substantially in issue in 
any pending civil proceedings shall not be a 
ground for any stay, prohibition or delay of 
the criminal proceedings. 

80. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 220. 

81. Section 22l of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended in subsection (I) by deleting the words "or 
third" appearing immediately after the words "a 
subordinate court of the second". 

82. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing Part VIII. 

83. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 261. 

84. The Critpinal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 301. 

No.5 

Insertion of section 
193A in Cap. 75. 

Rept:4. Vi "",,",UUII 

220 of Cap. 75. 

Amendment of 
section 221 of Cap. 
75: 

Repeal of pari VIII 
of Cap. 75. 

Repeal of section 
261 of Cap. 75. 

Repeal of section 
301 of Cap. 75. 



No.5 

Repeal of aection 
lOS of Cap. ". 

Amendment of 
section 306 of Cap. 
75. 

Amendment of 
section 307 of Cap. 
75. 

Insertion of Part 
IXA in Cap. 75. 

162 
Criminal Law (Amendment) 2003 

8S. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 305. 

86. Section 306 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended by deleting the words "and the statement or 
evidence (if any) of the accused person before the 
committing court has been given in evidence" wherever 
they occur. 

87. Section 307 of the Criminal Proceaure Code is 
amended by deleting subsection (2). 

,88. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
inserting the following new Part immediately after Part 
IX-

PART JXA-VICTIM IMPACT STATEMENTS 

Interpretation. 329 A. In this Part-

"family victim", in relation to an offence 
as a direct result of which a primary victim 
has died. means a person who was, at the 
time the offence was committed, a member 
of the primary victim's immediate family, 
and includes such a person whether or not 
the person has suffered persona] .hann as a 
result of the offence; 

"member of the primary victim's 
immediate family" means-

( a) the victim's spouse; 

(b) the victim's de facto spouse, being a 
person who has cohabited with the 
victim for at least 2 years; 

(c) a parent, guardian or step-parent of 
the victim; 

(d) a child or step~child of the victim or 



2003 

163 

Criminal lAw (Amendment) 

some other child for whom die 
victim is the guardian; or 

(e) ,a brother, sister, step-brother or 
step-sister of the victim; 

"personal harm" means actual physical 
bodily harm, mental illness or nervous 
shock 

"primary victimu
, in relation to an. 

offencet means-
(a) a person against whom the offence 

was conimitted; 
(b) a person who was a witness to the 

act of actual or threatened violence, 
the death or the infliction of the 
physical·bodiJy harm concerned, 
being a person who has suffered 
personal hann as a direct result of 
the offence; 

"victimu means a primary victim or a 
family victim; 

"victim impact statement" means a 
statement' containing particulars of.-

(a) in the case of a primary victim, any 
personal harm suffered by the 
victim as a direct result of the 
offence; or 

(b) in the case of a famiJy victim, the 
impaCt of the primary victim's 
death on the members of the 
primary victim's immediate famiJy. 

319B. This Part applies in relation to an 
offence that is being dealt with by any 
court, where the offence results in the death 
of. Or actual physical bodily harm to, any 
person. 

No.5. 

Application of 
Pan. 



No.5 

164 

Criminal Law (Ame1u1ment) 2003 

When victim 
impact 
statements may 
be received and 
considered. 

Victim impact 
statements 
discretionary. 

329c. (I) If it considers it appropriate to 
do so, a court may receive and con~ider a 
victim impact statement at any time after it . 
convicts, but before it sentences, an 
offender. 

(2) If the 'primary victim has died as·a 
direct result of the offence, the court shall 
receive a victim impact statement given by 
a family victim and acknowledge its receipt, 
and may make any comment on it that the 
court considers appropriate. 

(3) Notwithstanding subsections (1) and 
(2), the court-

(a) shall not consider a victim impact 
statement unless it has been filed by 
or on behalf of the victim to whom 
it relates or by or on behalf of the 
prosecutor; and 

(b) shall not consider a victim impact 
statement given by a family victim 
in connection with the 
detennination of the punishment for 
the offence unless it considers that it 
is appropriate to do so . .. 

(4) The court may make a victim impact 
statement available to the prosecutor, to the 
offender or to ~y other person on such 
conditions (which shall include conditions 
preventing the offender from retaining 
copies of the statement) as it considers 
appropriate. 

329D. (I) The· giving of a victim impact 
statement is not mandatory. 

(2) A victim impact statement shall not 
be received or considered by a court if the 
victim or any of the victims to whom the 
statement relates objects to the statement 
being given to the court. 



. . .. ' 

.' ... .;,. 

165 
2003 Criminal Law (Amendment) 

Formal 
requirements 
for victim 
impact 
statements. 

(3) The absence of a victim impact 
statement shall not give rise to any 
inference that an offence had little or no 
impact on a victim. 

329E. (1) A victim impact statement shall 
be in writing and shall comply with such 
other requirements as are prescribed by 
rules of court. 

(2) If a primary victim is incapable of 
providing infonnation for or objecting to a 
victim impact statement about the personal 
hann suffered by the victim, a member of 
the primary victim's immediate family or 
other representative of the victim may, 

. subject to rul~s of court, act On behalf of the 
victim for that purpose . 

. (3) A court may receive and consider a 
victim impact statement only if it is given in 
accordance with and complies with the 
requirements prescribed by or under this 
Part. 

Rules of court. 329F. The Chief Justice may make any 
rules of court necessary or expedient to be 
made for carrying this Part into effect. 

89. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 343. 

90. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 344. 

91. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
". repealing section 344A. 

.,." 

, 
.j 

No.5 

Repeal of section 
343 ofCsp. 75. 

Repeal of section 
344 ofCsp. 75. 

Repeal of section 
344A ofesp. 75 . 



1'10, .. 5 

Rt:peat of section 
34S ofCsp. 75: 

Amendment of 
section 347 of Cap. 
75. 

Amendment·of 
section 3S2 o(Cap. 
75. 

Amendment of 
section 354 of Cap. 
75. 

Rcpcaland 
replaccnmt of 
sedion 3~ ofOq>. 
75. 

166 

Criminal Law (Amendment) 2003 

92. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section 345. 

93. Section 347 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended in subsection (1) by deleting paragraph (b). 

94. Section 352 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended in sub~ection (1) by deleting paragraph.(ii). 

95. Section' 354 of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended in'subsection (3) by deleting the words "or 
cominit him for trial" appeanng in paragraph (a). 

96. The Criminal Procedure Code is amended by 
repealing section·384 and replacing it with the following 
new section--

Statements 
ineplilrly taken 
under section 2~. 

Cap. 80. 

384 .. (1) If a court before whOm a 
statement of a person recorded or 
purporting to be recorded under section 
246 of this Code is tendered or has been 
received in evidence !jnds ~t any 
provision of that section has not been 
complied with by the magistrate recordins 
the statement-

(a) it may take evidence that the 
person duly made the statement 
recorded; and 

(b) notwithstanding anything 
contained in section 97 of the 
Evidence Act, the statement shall 
be admitted, if the error has not 
injured the accused as to his 
defence on the merits. 



167 
Criminal Low (Amendment) 

97. Section 38S of the Criminal Procedure Code is 
amended 'by deleting the words "second or third class" 
and substituting therefor the words "or second classu 

98. The First Schedule to the Criminal Procedure 
Code is amended in the fifth coltJ.mn~ by deleting the 
words "Subordinate court of the .first or second class" 
wherever they occur and substituting therefor the words 
"Any subordinate ~ourt". 

99. The Evidence Act is amended by inserting the 
,Uowing new section immediately after section 25-

Cc.lIlff¥OIlI 
aencnI,!Y 
inadmissible. 

lSA. A confession or any admission of a 
fact tending to the proof of guilt made by an 
accused person is not admissible and shall 
not be proved as against such person unless 
it is made in court. 

100. The Evidence Act ~s amended by repealing 
section 2,8. 

ten. The Evidence Act is amended by repealing 
section 30. 

101. The Evidence Act is amended by repealing 
section 31. 

103. Section 124 of the Evidence Act is amended by 
inserting the following proviso-

Provided that where in a criminal case involving a 
sexual offence the only evidence'is that.of a child of 
tender years who is the alleged victim of the offence, the 
court shaH receive the evidence of the child and proceed 
to convict the accused person if, for reasons to be 
recorded in the proceedings, the court is satisfied that the 
child is telling the truth. 

No.5 

Aml:ndmr.nt of 
Ill!Ction 385 of Cap. 
15. 

Amir:ndment of 
Pint $Chedu1e 10 
Cap.. 7!S. 

Repeal of IICCtiaI 
28ofC.lO .. 

..... oflCCtion 
30 ofe..,. 11). 

ItepatI of JeCtiOO 
31 of Cap. 10. 

A.rraendri1cnt of 
section 124 of Cap. 
JO. 



J 

No.5 

Repeal of section 
12 of Cap. 65. 

]68 
Criminal Law (Amendment) 2003 

104. The Prevention of Corruption Act is amended by 
repealing sec;tion 12. 




